


The Fed delivered another 25-
basis point rate cut last week but 
bond yields have been moving 
higher ever since the Fed started 
its easing cycle. Now the 2-yearT-
Note yield and Fed Funds Rate 
have converged as the market 
suggests that the Fed is (or 
should be) done cutting rates.



Not only has the bond market re-
priced the likelihood of future rate 
cuts, but upward pressure on 
corporate bond yields has
become a direct headwind for 
stocks. BAA corporate bond yields 
are now higher than they were 6-
months ago and all the net gains 
for stocks in recent decades have 
come when bond yields have 
been moving lower, not higher. 



Expectations and action in the
bond market pressured equities 
last week. This led to a 13-1 down 
volume day on Wednesday (when 
the Fed announced its rate cut) 
and even though stocks bounced 
on Friday, the volume flows were 
less than convincing. 



Friday did produce the first
positive breadth day of the month 
for the S&P 500. 14 down days in 
a row is the worst stretch of 
breadth that I have ever 
personally witnessed. While it has 
now ended, it has left weakness in 
its wake.



In terms of new highs versus new
lows, we are back to a frowny-
face market. This is another 
headwind for overall strength 
from equities. 



Wednesday’s swoon was the first 
1%+ move in either direction in 
more than a month. Overall, last 
week was neither quiet (2 1%+ 
moves) nor strong (new lows > 
new highs every day).



The corollary to “bull markets 
feature quiet strength” is noise 
and weakness are characteristic of 
bear markets. If Santa-related 
strength is going to show up over 
the next couple of weeks, the best 
case for bulls is that it is quiet on 
the surface and strong beneath 
the surface.



Abc.

Bull Market Criteria Current Reading Bull Market Behavior?

 Weekly New High - New Lows                                                 
(As % of NYSE + NASDAQ Issues Traded)                                

Greater Than 0
Less Than 0                           

(1 Consecutive Week)
No

Net New High A/D Line                                                                  
NYSE + NASDAQ 

Rising
Falling                                  

(3 Days in a Row)
No

% of Global Markets Above                         
Their 50-Day Average

More Than 70%
Less Than 70%                      

(56 Days in a Row)
No

ACWI                                                                                      
Long-Term Trend

Rising
Rising                                     

(87 Consecutive Weeks)
Yes

S&P 500 200-Day Average                                                                                                 
(Level vs 10-Days Ago)

Rising
Rising                                   

(388 Days in a Row)
Yes

Value Line Geometric Index                                                                                     
Long-Term Trend

Rising
Rising                                     

(14 Consecutive Weeks)
Yes

(data as of 12/20/2024) Total: 3/6

Bull Market Behavior Checklist



Overall, bull market behavior is 
less evident. Our bull behavior 
composite has pulled back to its 
lowest level of 2024. Breadth has
broken down, but price trends 
have remained resilient.



Global weakness led the 
deterioration and has not yet 
signaled improvement. The 
percentage of ACWI markets 
above their 50-day averages or 
200-day averages are near their 
lowest levels of the year. Without
a domestic breadth thrust regime
to provide a tailwind, US stocks 
are increasingly dependent on 
global rally participation – and 
that is not coming through right 
now.



In terms of the cyclical weight of
the evidence, both liquidity and 
breadth are under pressure. From 
a tactical perspective, our fear or 
strength model has turned 
negative. It is true that stocks rise 
75% of the time, but the data 
suggests we are currently in the 
25% of the time during which 
stocks struggle to even tread 
water.



Sector-level momentum, price and breadth trends reflect the deterioration that has occurred this month. At the end of November, this was a sea of 
green. Now it is a sea of red..



In aggregate, sector-level trends 
are finishing the year at their 
worst levels of the year. 



The number of sectors holding
above their 200-day averages
continues to shrink. In this 
middling environment, the S&P 
500 tends to muddle along.
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